
 
 

Media Advisory 
 

Canada’s largest eco-friendly commercial landscaping initiative launched by 
Bentall Kennedy in Mississauga 

 

WHEN:   
Wednesday, June 22, 2016 - Event starts at 10:00 a.m. with speakers at 10:30 a.m. 
 

WHAT:  
Bentall Kennedy will officially announce Canada’s largest low-emission and all-electric commercial 
landscape management program at the Meadowvale North Business Park.  A demonstration of the 
specialized equipment and solar charging system will take place. 
 

Bentall Kennedy, a Sun Life Investment Management company, is one of North America's largest real 
estate investment advisors and one of its foremost providers of real estate services. Bentall Kennedy 
serves the interests of more than 550 institutional clients and investors managing approximately $43 
billion of assets across office, retail, industrial, and multi-residential properties.  
 

Meadowvale North Business Park consists of 170 acres and is home to corporate offices and prestige 
industrial facilities for tenants such as Microsoft Canada, Maple Leaf Foods, Amgen, Baxter Canada, 
LoyaltyOne, Ryan ULC, Creation Technologies, Martin Brower, Tech Data and Bosch Canada. 
 

WHO: 
Bob Delaney, MPP (Mississauga—Streetsville) and Parliamentary Assistant to the Minister of Energy 
Nada Sutic, General Manager, Bentall Kennedy 
Michael-Anthony Gucciardi, Environment and Sustainability Manager, International Landscaping Inc. 
Alex Dumesle, Sr. Manager, Partners in Project Green at Toronto Regional Conservation Authority 
 

WHERE:  
6985 Financial Drive – Bentall Kennedy Properties, Mississauga, ON L5N 8E8 
 

 
For more information, to schedule interviews or secure high quality images, please contact: 

Don Huff, President, ECO Strategy, 416-805-7720 or huffd@ecostrategy.ca  

mailto:huffd@ecostrategy.ca


 
 
About Bentall Kennedy 
 
Bentall Kennedy, a Sun Life Investment Management company, is one of North America's largest real 
estate investment advisors and one of its foremost providers of real estate services. Bentall Kennedy 
serves the interests of more than 550 institutional clients and investors managing approximately $43 
billion of assets across office, retail, industrial, and multi-residential properties throughout Canada and 
the U.S. (as of the most recently completed fiscal quarter). Bentall Kennedy is a member of UN PRI and a 
recognized Responsible Property Investing leader ranked 1st globally in its peer group in the 2015 Global 
Real Estate Sustainability Benchmark (GRESB). Bentall Kennedy includes Bentall Kennedy (Canada) 
Limited Partnership, Bentall Kennedy (U.S.) Limited Partnership and the real estate and commercial 
mortgage investment groups of certain of their affiliates, all of which comprise a team of real estate 
professionals spanning multiple legal entities. The assets under management shown above include real 
estate equity and mortgage investments of the companies within Bentall Kennedy (excluding AUM 
relating to the bcIMC account). All amounts cited are in Canadian dollars. For more information, visit 
www.bentallkennedy.com/. 
 

http://www.bentallkennedy.com/

